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             he new frontier of Web 
2.0 is not just about informing 
your customers; it’s about commu-
nicating with them. Today’s Web 
2.0 tools, such as blogs, Twitter, 
Facebook, LinkedIn and the many 
other social media options, are all 
about customer engagement.
 When you send your prospects 
or clients an e-mail, a mailer or a 

newsletter, or when you place a TV, 
radio or print ad, you’re informing 
your audience about something. 
Th ose are information-age tools 
that still have a purpose.
 However, social media is about 
the communication age. You’re at-
tempting to create a dialogue, try-
ing to get engagement, and hoping 
to elicit a response. So it’s not just 

about talking; it’s about listening. 
Ultimately, social media is not 
about the “media”; it’s about the 
“social” – about trying to get people 
talking about something important 
to them and to your business.

What’s Your Focus?
 In order to make the best busi-
ness use of social media, your          
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organization needs to pinpoint 
the specifi c message you want to 
put out so that all employees have 
a guide to follow. Th at way they 
know what direction their mes-
sages should take and how they 
should focus their posts. In other 
words, is your company’s focus 
to increase customer service? Are 
you trying to enhance awareness of 
your products or services? Do you 
want to boost your brand recogni-
tion? Each of these items would 
have a diff erent message on which 
your employees should focus.
 For example, one insurance 
company uses Twitter and Face-
book to let people know all the 
philanthropic things they are doing 
for the community. All the posts 
are about events they’re sponsoring 
and contributions they’re making. 
Employees know that they should 
post information about personal 
things they’re doing for the com-
munity, such as volunteering at the 
local animal shelter or helping out 
with Habitat for Humanity®. With 
a clear guideline that establishes 
that the social media eff ort is to in-
crease philanthropic awareness, it’s 

easy for employees to know what 
they should be posting on social 
media sites. Th ey have a clear focus 
and a unifi ed purpose.
 Another company in the retail 
industry uses social media to im-
prove customer service. All their 
posts highlight things they’re doing 
internally to improve the customer 
experience, what they’re doing on-
line to make shopping easier and 
how they’re handling phone inqui-
ries to deliver a memorable shop-
ping experience. Th ey also regu-
larly ask customers how they’d like 
the company to improve customer 
service. With that as the key mes-
sage, all the company’s employ-
ees are focused on problem solv-
ing and on making the customers        
happy.
 Th erefore, a good social media 
strategy and employee guidelines 
are far more than a list of good and 
bad words or topics. Instead, they 
need to focus on the core mes-
sage your company wants to por-
tray and determine the best ways 
to spread that core message. Th at’s 
why upper management needs to 
take the time to determine the core 
message and communicate it to all 
employees.

Creating the Guidelines
 Creating social media guide-
lines for your company does not 
have to be diffi  cult. Once you clar-
ify the core message you want to 
project and the dialogue you want 
them to engage with, use the fol-
lowing tips to create principles that 
your staff  can use to shape their 
posts according to the strategy. 
(Note: the following suggestions 
are general in nature. Please adhere 
to your state’s HR laws, and seek le-
gal counsel as needed.)

 • Build trust – Your employees 
should use their posts to build a 
reputation of trust among clients, 
media and the public. When they 
are reaching out to others on social 
media sites, they should take ev-
ery opportunity to establish them-
selves as a credible and transparent 
representative of the company.
 • Transparency – When par-
ticipating in any online commu-
nity, your employees should dis-
close their identity and affi  liation 
with the organization, clients, and 
professional and/or personal inter-
est. When posting to a blog, they 
should always use their real name, 
not an alias.
 • Be direct – When creating 
posts and content, your employees 
should be direct, informative and 
brief. Th ey should never use a cli-
ent’s name in a posting unless they 
have written permission to do so.
 •  Give due credit – If your em-
ployees post copyrighted materials, 
they should identify the original 
source. Th is includes sources for 
direct or paraphrased quotes, pho-
tos, videos and anything else they 
did not originally create.
 • Self-edit – Your employees 
should always evaluate their post-
ing’s accuracy and truthfulness. 
Before posting any online material, 
they need to ensure that the mate-
rial is accurate and truthful. Th is 
includes checking spelling and 
grammar on everything. Remem-
ber, content never disappears en-
tirely once it’s been posted. Should 
your employees fi nd an error, have 
them correct it promptly. Since 
transparency is key, have them ad-
mit the mistake, apologize if neces-
sary, correct it and move on.
 • Responsibility – Make sure 
employees know that they are re-

Therefore, 
a   good social 
media strategy 
and employee 
guidelines are   far 
more than a list of 
good and bad words 
or topics. 
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sponsible for what they post. Nega-
tive or questionable posts will not 
be tolerated. Additionally, while 
what they do on their own per-
sonal pages during personal time 
is their business, what they publish 
on those sites should not be attrib-
uted to the company and should 
not appear as endorsements from 
the company. If they choose to list 
their employer on a personal social 
network, then they must regard all 
communication on that network as 
they would in a professional net-
work. Online lives, whether per-
sonal or professional, are ultimate-
ly linked.
 • Be professional – When post-
ing comments, employees should 
refrain from writing about contro-
versial or potentially infl ammatory 
subjects, including politics, sex, 
religion or any other non-business 
related subjects. Th e tone of their 
comments should be respectful 
and informative, never conde-
scending or “loud.” Additionally, 
they should avoid personal attacks, 
online fi ghts and hostile commu-
nications. If a blogger or any other 
online infl uencer posts a statement 
with which your company dis-
agrees, your employees can voice 
their opinions, but not escalate the 
conversation to a heated argument. 
Instruct them on how to write rea-
sonably, factually and with good 
humor.
 • Privacy – Employees should 
never disclose proprietary or confi -
dential information. Th is includes 
product releases, service updates 
and employee information not 
made public yet.
 • Obey the rules – All employ-
ees should follow local, state and 
federal laws and regulations; the 
company’s internal rules (typically 

found in the employee handbook); 
as well as the rules established by 
each social networking venue. Ul-
timately their online activities will 
be a refl ection on the company.

Propel Your Message Forward
 Today’s Web 2.0 tools are great 
for business building, provided 
your employees know how to use 
them for the company’s ultimate 
benefi t. Th erefore, determine why 
your company is using social me-
dia sites, and then let that purpose 
be known throughout the entire 
organization. Additionally, imple-
ment clear social media guidelines 
that employees can follow, and 
you’ll have the people, processes 
and tools you need to further your 
company’s mission online. Ulti-
mately, when employees know how 
they are supposed to use today’s 
Web 2.0 tools, they can do so with 
focus and purpose, leading the 
organization confi dently into the 
communication age. 

Creating social 
media guidelines 

for your company 
does not have to be 

difficult.
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