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Gathering Information About Your Competitors | Dave Kahle

totally out of that account. I was blindsided.
	 That’s a lesson that sticks with me, and it’s one from 
which you can learn. To become good at knowing what 
your competition is up to, implement the following 
simple three-step process.

Collect Bits and Pieces of Information
	 Begin by consciously collecting little bits and pieces 
of information at every opportunity. For example, you 
may have lost a bid or a particular piece of business to 
your competitors. Rather than just moping about it, 
use it as a learning opportunity. Try to find out from 
your customer why they awarded the business the way 
they did. If it was price alone, try to find out how much 
lower their price was. This information won’t help for 
that particular piece of business, but it may give you an 
insight into the pricing policies of your competition. If 
it’s something else, find out what. Write the informa-
tion down on a 3 x 5 card, a piece of scrap paper or a 
post-it.
	 Take your good customers to lunch, casually see if 
you can steer the conversation in such a way as to learn 
something about your competition. Keep your eyes 
open to the comings and goings of competitive sales-
men. Also, make sure to note when you see them and at 
which account. Be aware of competitive literature, busi-
ness cards and price quotes lying around. Don’t forget 
to talk to the other salespeople who work for your com-
pany, to gain their insights.
	 All of these are ways to collect bits and pieces of 
information. By themselves, they won’t help much, but 
if you combine these snippets, you may see trends, un-
cover strategies, and discover tactics your competition 
is using.

Store the Information
	 As you collect each bit of information, capture it by 
writing it down and putting the note in a manila folder 
marked “competition.” Or, store it in an electronic file 
on your computer. You may even have a separate folder 
for each major competitor. Regardless of your method, 
what you’re doing is assembling a quantity of informa-
tion. Diligently collect those bits and pieces of informa-
tion and file them away.

Use the Information
	 After you have collected enough information, you’ll 
be able to open that file on a regular basis, consider all 
the pieces and discover a great deal about your com-
petitors. 
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 Th e trick is to consistently collect and store infor-
mation. Eventually you’ll assemble an accurate picture. 
It’s like the popular game show Wheel of Fortune. When 
Vanna White turns over one letter, it doesn’t reveal the 
answer. Aft er she’s turned over several of these pieces, 
however, the whole becomes clear and the answer to 
the riddle is simple to understand. Th at’s the way col-
lecting information about your competition works.
 Th e back of an old business card on which you not-
ed that you saw a competitive sales person showing a 
new line of widgets, by itself, doesn’t mean much. If you 
fi led that along with other bits of information you’ve 
collected and then analyze it, you might see an entirely 
diff erent situation. 
 Suppose you reviewed that business card note, 
combined with the notes you made yourself regarding 
some sales literature about the competitive widget line 
that you saw on a purchasing agent’s desk. Th is leads 
you to notice that you lost a major bid to the competi-
tion because he quoted a new line at lower-than-tradi-
tional prices. 
 All at once you’ve uncovered a potential threat 
to your business. Clearly, your competitor is pushing 
a new, lower priced widget line. You didn’t learn that 
from any one piece of information, but rather from the 
combination of all those pieces as a whole.
 In the Information Age economy, much of your 
ability to make good decisions depends on your abil-
ity to collect good information. If you are going to take 
your performance up a notch, you must see yourself as 
a dealer in information as well as a seller of stuff . Get 
good at collecting useful information. 
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